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1R/22/2020 GLA University Mail - Fwd: Regarding the Payment for AIR Legal database and Print Journals 2020-21

GLA Ajay Sharma <ajay.sharma@gla.ac.in>

= | UNIVERSITY
et g A5 | MATHURA,

Fwd: Regarding the Payment for AIR Legal database and Print Journals 2020-21

Mitrapal Singh <mitrapal.singh@gla.ac.in> 22 December 2020 at 14:21
To: Ajay Sharma <ajay.sharma@gla.ac.in>

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Mitrapal Singh <mitrapal.singh@gla.ac.in>

Date: Fri, Nov 27, 2020 at 12:11 PM

Subject: Regarding the Payment for AIR Legal database and Print Journals 2020-21

To: <amitdelhi@airinfotechservices.com>

To
AIR INFOTECH SERVICES PVT. LTD.
o 213, Satyam Apartment, Wardha Road, Dhantoli.

Nagpur- 440012

Dear Sir,

Please find enclosed herewith the UTR No. IOBAM 20330653114 dated
25.11.2020 for Rs. 123301.00 /- against Invoice no. AIS/2020-21/137 dated 28.10.2020

towards the Service of e-database.
It is requested that the same may kindly be accepted and the receipt for the same may be
sent to the undersigned.

Thanking you,

Yours sincerely

Mitrapal Singh
Assistant Librarian

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0?ik=c61fb763fc&view=pt&search=all&permmsgid=msg-f%3A1686767830335512672&simpl=msg-f%3A16867678... 1/1
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proper channc

or- Regarding the pa yment for subscription rencwal of “AIR Online Database and Print

‘.}ournais,,fm' scar 2019-20. (AIR D BCI Combo offer)

With- due rezords. 1 have to say that the subscription of renewed for “AIR Online
Database and Print Journals Annual Subscription, the year = 2019-20 commencing

from ©1.08.201v 10 30.07 ’20’7 y. For which @ demand uat‘t of T 121771/ ist0 he issued

in favor of “AIR Infotech Services Pyt Ltd.” The payment ¢an also be made

L electronicaiiy.
5 I therefore. request you to kindly accord the permission and sanction e said amount
for the same. - 5
e The detailed information along with approval is herewith enclosed for your ready
reference. ,‘47-75 6’
_Thanking you. = ,\
5 X2 . il

TN g . e ow D i "\\\ , :
Yours sincerely. ."."':'»//~ RPN S NPW

»-"

T’f 1pa¥ Singh
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To

AIR Infotech Service Pyt Litd

213, Satyam Apparment

Wardha Road Dhantoli Nagpur-440012

04 042018

Sub: - Purchase order for subscription of “AlR Comprehensive Databases.

Dear Sir.

With reference to your Performa Invoice No. A1S/2018/154 dated 14/03/2018, we are pleased to
place the order of subscribe the AIR Comprehensive Databases.

Cost

S Title Year ) Qty Total | Dis Amount | Tax Total Grossj
% N , Amount | % ®) % | Amount | Amount
P~ ,  Alfter ®) ®
3. S Discount Ra
1 | AIR Supreme 1950-18 4 28000 112000 | 62.36 | 42156.80 18 7588.22 | 49745.02 .
Court DataBase : ;
| Lesearch . ] ok : 312 1 fav
2 | AIR High Court 1950-18 4 28000 | 112000 | 62.36 | 42156.80 18 | 758822 | 49745.02
DataBase Lesearch ' : v ¥
3 | Criminal Law 1950-18 4 {.27500 | 110000 | 62 41800.00 18 | 7524.00 .| -49324.00
.| Journal DataBase ;
Lesearch _
4 | AIR PRIVY 1900-50 4 25000 | 100000 | 62 38000.00 18 | 6840.00 | 44840.00
Council DataBase Ve i ' R f
5 AIR Online 4 10000 40000 40 24000.00 18 4320.00 [ 28320.00
Institutibnal vision :
Subscription for 0
four Connections ,
o 118500 | 474000 188113.6 . 33860.44 221974.04
4 "‘\: Terms & conditions
1. Please acknowledge the receipt of this order.
2. Publisher’s list price will be allowed.
Thanking you,
Yours gruly,
)
(Ashok Kumar Singh)
gyz Registrar }
/7

Encl.: as said above

17 K Ston, NH-2, Mathura

Tel - +91-5662-250900 £909 || Websii




scription of AIR Comprehensive Databases.

Jyoti Gupta <jyoti.gupta@gla.ac.in>

ubscription of AIR Comprehensive Databases.

Jyoti Gupta <iyoti.gupta@gla.ac.in> Wed, Apr 4, 2018 at 5:30 PM
To: amitdelhi@airinfotechservices.com

04.04.2018

To

AIR Infotech Service Pvt Ltd

213, Satyam Apparment

Wardha Road Dhantoli Nagpur-440012
Cont No. - 08076118901, 09716301470

amitdelhi@airinfotechservices.com
Subject: Subscription of AIR Comprehensive Databases.

P Sir,
N\

o
e

o

With reference to the subject as cited above, the advance payments of T 44395.00 (Forty Four
Thousands Three Hundreds Ninety Five Only) which is 20% of total amount ¥ 221974.00 has been
made through NEFT (UTR No.: IOBAN-18094566534), dated 04/04/2018 of the Indian Overseas Bank,
GLA University, Mathura as per details given in your invoice towards the subscription of “AIR

Comprehensive Databases.

O

Kindly acknowledge the receipt of the payment, and the receipt for the same may be send to the
undersigned or mailed at librarian@gla.ac.in.

Yours sincerely,

Dr. Jyoti Gupta
¢ Assistant Librarian
E Central Library
f GLA University Mathura, 281406

- ﬁ.f%&jyoti.gupta@g!a.ac.in
&79634686922
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To. : : Date: 06.04.2018

The Vice Chancellor,
GLA University,
Mathura

Through proper channel.

Subject: Regarding the PDC (P,ost-datéd cheque) of August 1, 2018 for ¥ 177579.00.

S ir,

With due regards, a PDC (Post-dated cheque) of 'A.u"gust- 1, 2018, for remaining payments of T
177579.00 (total amount 221974.00) is to be issued in favour of “AIR INFOTECH
SERVICES PVT LTD” Ttowards thé subscription of AIR Compréhensive Databases. The

detailed information is attached with this letter for your ready reference.
: 5 :

I, therefore, request you to kindly issue the PDC for the said amount.

—

Thanking you,

- Yaurs sincerely. - ' ; F@('u) MOLQ,‘Q

%@“\\% " @a = |
Y P g@ L/\‘),c
Dr. Jyoti Gupta : s

(Assistant Librarian)
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AIR INFOTECH SERVICES PVT LTD

* a aéﬁ GLA Engg. College, Ajhai Branch (1298)
GLA Engg. Coliege, Village & Post Office Ajhai,

5 ' tathura - 281405
dian Overseas Bank IFS CODE : iOBA0C01959 IGE
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